

WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation	Total
Data Preservation							
01_Project Scoping/Engagement Planning							
4/1/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0001: Meeting with D. Griffith (A&M) & A. Dickie (PwC) to discuss the status of the Fiance, Corp Services, Home Loans and Commercial industries.	\$550.00	1.00	\$550.00	
4/1/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0002: Meeting with D. Griffith (A&M) & B. Vanderbush to discuss the status of the Fiance, Corp Services, Home Loans and Commercial industries.	\$380.00	1.00	\$380.00	
4/1/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0003: Meeting with W. Conolly, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki & A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$550.00	1.00	\$550.00	
4/1/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0004: Meeting with W. Conolly, A. Dickie, B. Vanderbush, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$380.00	1.00	\$380.00	
4/1/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0005: Meeting with A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki, B. Vanderbush, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$425.00	1.00	\$425.00	
4/1/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0006: Meeting with W. Conolly, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki, B. Vanderbush (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$235.00	1.00	\$235.00	
4/1/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0007: Meeting with W. Conolly, C. Nakagaki, B. Vanderbush, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$380.00	1.00	\$380.00	
4/1/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0008: Prepare for review of Infrastructure memos (Sharepoint administration).	\$425.00	2.10	\$892.50	

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation	Total
4/1/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0009: Review of Infrastructure Application memo comments from C. Nakagaki (PwC).	\$425.00	0.80	\$340.00	
4/2/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0010: Prepare fee estimate for February 2009 and March 2009 for the team's project time and expenses.	\$380.00	1.00	\$380.00	
4/2/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0011: Run reports and review status of application documentation.	\$550.00	0.80	\$440.00	
4/2/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0012: Prepare Status Update summary information.	\$550.00	1.00	\$550.00	
4/3/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0013: Edit Status Update summary information.	\$550.00	0.50	\$275.00	
4/7/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0014: Run queries to update high level statistics/summary numbers for the Transaction Data Work Flow Status Update.	\$235.00	0.50	\$117.50	
4/8/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0015: Meeting with W. Conolly, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langenkamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$380.00	1.20	\$456.00	
4/8/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0016: Meeting with W. Conolly, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki (PwC), T. Langenkamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$235.00	1.20	\$282.00	
4/8/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0017: Meeting with W. Conolly, A. Dickie, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langenkamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$380.00	1.20	\$456.00	
4/8/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0018: Meeting with A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langenkamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$425.00	1.20	\$510.00	
4/8/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0019: Review of Action items for Infrastructure and Retail.	\$425.00	0.70	\$297.50	
4/9/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0020: Send emails to coordinate discussions with Infrastructure Application Owners (Guy Duryee - WaMu).	\$425.00	1.80	\$765.00	

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/9/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0021: Communicate pushback from Application Owners to engagement management.	\$425.00	1.50	\$637.50
4/15/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0022: Meeting with W. Conolly, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$550.00	1.30	\$715.00
4/15/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0023: Meeting with B. Vanderbush, W. Conolly, A. Dickie, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$380.00	1.30	\$494.00
4/15/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0024: Meeting with B. Vanderbush, W. Conolly, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$235.00	1.30	\$305.50
4/15/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0025: Continue Meeting with A. Dickie, W. Conolly, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$550.00	0.80	\$440.00
4/15/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0026: Continue Meeting with B. Vanderbush, W. Conolly, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$425.00	0.80	\$340.00
4/15/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0027: Continue Meeting with B. Vanderbush, W. Conolly, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$380.00	0.80	\$304.00
4/15/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0028: Meeting with D. Griffith, T. Langenkamp (A&M), J. Maciel (WMI) to discuss overall data preservation workflow as well as walk through Finance industry data flow diagram.	\$380.00	1.10	\$418.00

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/15/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0029: Development of models to represent archival timeline for applications across all industries.	\$380.00	1.30	\$494.00
4/15/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0030: Update decommission dates in system with statistics from the Source to Target Mapping spreadsheet and other sources.	\$425.00	2.00	\$850.00
4/15/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0031: Creation of Revise Application Decommission schedule, Data Preservation chart draft and supporting queries for T. Langencamp (A&M) presentation to the JPMC Steering Committee.	\$425.00	1.50	\$637.50
4/15/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0032: Continue creation of Revise Application Decommission schedule and Data Preservation chart draft.	\$425.00	0.50	\$212.50
4/16/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0033: Revise Application Decommission schedule and Data Preservation chart.	\$425.00	1.80	\$765.00
4/16/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0034: Finalization and printing of Application Decommission schedule and Data Preservation chart.	\$425.00	1.50	\$637.50
4/19/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0035: Review application documentation status across all industries.	\$550.00	0.90	\$495.00
4/20/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0036: Development of reports to track application tiering, documentation and collection over time.	\$380.00	3.60	\$1,368.00
4/20/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0037: Prepare Status Update summary information.	\$550.00	1.00	\$550.00
4/21/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0038: Reschedule status meeting from 1:30 to 3:00 including booking rooms and sending alternate meeting invite.	\$425.00	0.20	\$85.00
4/22/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0039: Meeting with J. Harres (WaMu) to talk about NAS and ED data transfer.	\$425.00	0.30	\$127.50
4/22/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0040: Schedule meeting with J. Harres (WaMu) for infrastructure application review.	\$425.00	0.30	\$127.50

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/23/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0041: Meeting with W. Conolly, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$550.00	1.30	\$715.00
4/23/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0042: Meeting with B. Vanderbush, W. Conolly, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$380.00	1.30	\$494.00
4/23/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0043: Meeting with B. Vanderbush, W. Conolly, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki (PwC), T. Langencamp, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$235.00	1.30	\$305.50
4/23/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0044: Meeting with B. Vanderbush, W. Conolly, A. Dickie, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$380.00	1.30	\$494.00
4/23/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0045: Prepare Status Update summary information.	\$550.00	0.50	\$275.00
4/25/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0046: Review billing summary and exhibits produced by Bankruptcy Billing Team.	\$380.00	1.80	\$684.00
4/28/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0047: Update application tracking database by collapsing smaller industries into larger industries.	\$380.00	0.30	\$114.00
4/28/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0048: Prepare information related to project time and expense billing file.	\$380.00	1.00	\$380.00
4/28/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0049: Prepare for meeting with Hogan Retail Application Owners.	\$425.00	1.20	\$510.00
4/28/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0050: Review application documentation status across all industries.	\$550.00	0.80	\$440.00
4/29/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0051: Meeting with W. Conolly, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$550.00	1.30	\$715.00
4/29/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0052: Meeting with B. Vanderbush, W. Conolly, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$380.00	1.30	\$494.00

WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation	Total
4/29/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0053: Meeting with B. Vanderbush, W. Conolly, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki (PwC), T. Langencamp, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$235.00	1.30	\$305.50	
4/29/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0054: Meeting with B. Vanderbush, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$425.00	1.30	\$552.50	
4/29/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0055: Meeting with B. Vanderbush, W. Conolly, A. Dickie, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, and D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$380.00	1.30	\$494.00	
4/29/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0056: Meeting with C. Nakagaki and W. Conolly (PwC) to discuss Retail Industry and Overall Project Strategy.	\$550.00	0.50	\$275.00	
4/29/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0057: Meeting with B. Vanderbush and W. Conolly (PwC) to discuss Retail Industry and Overall Project Strategy.	\$380.00	0.50	\$190.00	
4/29/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0058: Meeting with B. Vanderbush and C. Nakagaki (PwC) to discuss Retail Industry and Overall Project Strategy.	\$425.00	0.50	\$212.50	
4/29/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0059: Draft and compile initial estimate for Project Water team's time and expenses for April 2009.	\$380.00	0.60	\$228.00	
4/29/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0060: Prepare Status Update summary information.	\$550.00	0.80	\$440.00	
4/30/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0061: Review application documentation status across all industries.	\$550.00	0.70	\$385.00	
4/30/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0062: Draft summary update presentation slides.	\$550.00	0.70	\$385.00	
Total Hours and Compensation for 01_Project Scoping/Engagement Planning					66.40	\$27,753.00	
02_Identify/Obtain/Process of Electronic Stored Information							
4/1/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0063: Review application documentation memos for Infrastructure applications.	\$550.00	1.00	\$550.00	

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/2/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0064: Draft e-mail follow-up to Jeff Weinstein (WaMu) on Card Services industry applications.	\$380.00	0.50	\$190.00
4/2/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0065: Review application documentation memos for Retail applications.	\$550.00	1.70	\$935.00
4/3/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0066: Draft e-mail follow-up to Laura Alatorre (WaMu) on Card Services industry applications.	\$380.00	0.50	\$190.00
4/6/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0067: Draft e-mail follow-up for L. Alatorre (WaMu) for Card Services industry applications.	\$380.00	1.30	\$494.00
4/7/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0068: Review General Ledger detail transmission options to determine how best to move General Ledger detail extract into WMI possession.	\$380.00	1.70	\$646.00
4/9/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0069: Update application tracking database to track N/A as Data Collection Status and update format of relevant reports.	\$380.00	2.20	\$836.00
4/9/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0070: Communicate pushback from Application Owners to engagement management.	\$425.00	0.80	\$340.00
4/9/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0071: Meeting with G. Duryee (Heritage WaMu) to discuss Cisci Wireless Router Software.	\$425.00	0.80	\$340.00
4/9/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0072: Creation and Review of Infrastructure Application Memos and Received documentation.	\$425.00	1.30	\$552.50
4/13/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0073: Discussion with S. Kamran, J. Scheffrahn (A&M), A. Lai and W. Conolly (PwC) to discuss Infrastructure industry applications.	\$380.00	0.80	\$304.00
4/13/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0074: Discussion with S. Kamran, J. Scheffrahn (A&M), A. Lai and C. Nakagaki (PwC) to discuss Infrastructure industry applications.	\$425.00	0.80	\$340.00
4/13/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0075: Update application tracking database to track N/A as Data Collection Status and update format of relevant reports.	\$380.00	1.30	\$494.00

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/13/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0076: Reconciliation/Download of documentation provided for Card Services through Data Exchange.	\$235.00	2.30	\$540.50
4/13/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0077: Review of Infrastructure Application Memos.	\$425.00	2.10	\$892.50
4/13/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0078: Revise latest action items tracking spreadsheet.	\$425.00	1.80	\$765.00
4/14/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0079: Discussion with B. Beake (A&M) and W. Conolly (PwC) to discuss status of Infrastructure industry applications.	\$380.00	1.80	\$684.00
4/14/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0080: Discussion with B. Beake (A&M) and C. Nakagaki (PwC) to discuss status of Infrastructure industry applications.	\$425.00	1.80	\$765.00
4/14/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0081: Draft follow-up emails for infrastructure and retail related Application Owners (did not send pending steering committee meeting on Wednesday).	\$425.00	1.30	\$552.50
4/14/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0082: Review application documentation memos for Infrastructure applications.	\$550.00	1.00	\$550.00
4/15/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0083: Meeting with B. Vanderbush, A. Dickie, C. Nakagaki, A. Lai (PwC), T. Langencamp, B. Beake, D. Griffith (A&M) to discuss status and issues related to all industries.	\$425.00	1.30	\$552.50
4/15/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0084: Review out of scope applications, and track which applications we need to follow up on.	\$235.00	2.10	\$493.50
4/16/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0085: Meeting with C. Nakagaki (PwC) to discuss Card Services industry applications.	\$235.00	0.80	\$188.00
4/16/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0086: Meeting with A. Lai (PwC) to discuss Card Services industry applications.	\$380.00	0.80	\$304.00
4/16/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0087: Review descope applications, and track which applications we need to follow up on.	\$235.00	2.50	\$587.50
4/16/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0088: Follow-up email to Dave Pride (WaMu).	\$425.00	0.20	\$85.00

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/16/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0089: Follow-up email to John Loendorf (WaMu).	\$425.00	0.40	\$170.00
4/16/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0090: Review Finance application documentation for relevance and data classification.	\$550.00	2.00	\$1,100.00
4/16/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0091: Review dataflow diagrams and application documentation.	\$550.00	2.30	\$1,265.00
4/17/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0092: Prepare to take over ownership of infrastructure applications.	\$235.00	0.20	\$47.00
4/17/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0093: Draft e-mail follow-up to J. Weinstein (WaMu) regarding Card Services industry data preservation request.	\$380.00	0.50	\$190.00
4/17/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0094: Continued to draft emails for update, pending steering committee communication to Application Owners.	\$425.00	1.50	\$637.50
4/17/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0095: Review dataflow diagrams and application documentation.	\$550.00	1.60	\$880.00
4/17/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0096: Review Home Loans application documentation for relevance and data classification.	\$550.00	0.80	\$440.00
4/17/2009	Bruce A Vanderbush	Partner	0309H0097: Review Infrastructure application documentation for relevance and data classification.	\$550.00	1.50	\$825.00
4/20/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0098: Draft e-mail follow-up for technology owners of e-Commerce, and Marketing industry applications.	\$380.00	0.80	\$304.00
4/20/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0099: Review retail and application infrastructure memos.	\$425.00	1.80	\$765.00
4/20/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0100: Email to management discussing latest communication from Pete Gerrald regarding resuming information sharing with WMI.	\$425.00	0.80	\$340.00
4/20/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0101: Draft email response, including application tiering information, to Kathy Knutson, and send draft to management for approval.	\$425.00	2.30	\$977.50

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/21/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0102: Meeting with C. Nakagaki (PwC) to discuss Infrastructure industry applications and call Infrastructure application owners.	\$235.00	0.80	\$188.00
4/21/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0103: Meeting with C. Nakagaki (PwC) to discuss Infrastructure industry applications.	\$235.00	0.30	\$70.50
4/21/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0104: Meeting with A. Lai (PwC) to discuss Infrastructure industry applications.	\$380.00	0.30	\$114.00
4/21/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0105: Call and meeting with K. Knutson (WaMu) to discuss Remaining Retail Applications and communication with Application Owners.	\$425.00	1.90	\$807.50
4/21/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0106: Follow up e-mails to Infrastructure Application Owners, check past correspondence, update status on recent correspondence, and review memos.	\$235.00	3.00	\$705.00
4/21/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0107: Continue to follow up e-mails to Infrastructure Application Owners, check past correspondence, update status on recent correspondence, and review memos.	\$235.00	1.40	\$329.00
4/21/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0108: Follow up e-mails to Infrastructure Application Owners, check past correspondence, update status on recent correspondence, review memos, and prep for Infrastructure Application Owner calls for 4/22.	\$235.00	2.00	\$470.00
4/21/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0109: Respond to e-mail follow-ups for technology owners of e-Commerce, and Marketing industry applications.	\$380.00	1.00	\$380.00
4/21/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0110: Review correspondence related to Marketing industry technology owner contacts and respond to e-mail inquiries from Marketing industry contacts.	\$380.00	0.80	\$304.00
4/21/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0111: Draft e-mail follow-up for technology owners of Infrastructure, Retail, e-Commerce, and Marketing industry applications.	\$380.00	1.50	\$570.00

WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation	Total
4/21/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0112: Prepare Infrastructure action item list and send to A. Lai (PwC) for review.	\$425.00	0.50	\$212.50	
4/21/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0113: Send Kathy Knutson (WaMu) finalized Retail Application materials.	\$425.00	0.30	\$127.50	
4/21/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0114: Review Dave Pride's (WaMu) response regarding the latest status of Infrastructure Applications and prepare an example communication to Infrastructure Application owners.	\$425.00	0.50	\$212.50	
4/21/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0115: Draft email to Kathy Knutson (WaMu), including new language to send to application owners for future information requests.	\$425.00	1.30	\$552.50	
4/21/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0116: Draft and send email to Jason Herres (WaMu) to re-initiate discussions around his Infrastructure Applications and Teradata.	\$425.00	0.50	\$212.50	
4/21/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0117: Draft email to G. Duryee (WaMu) to re-initiate data sharing for files related to an infrastructure application memo.	\$425.00	0.40	\$170.00	
4/22/2009	Alan L. Lai	Associate	0309H0118: Meeting with S. Kamram (A&M) to discuss data preservation efforts being made for the NetBackup application.	\$235.00	0.30	\$70.50	
4/22/2009	Alan L. Lai	Associate	0309H0119: Follow up e-mails to Infrastructure Application Owners, check past correspondence, update status on recent correspondence, review memos, and prep for Infrastructure Application Owner calls.	\$235.00	1.20	\$282.00	
4/22/2009	Alan L. Lai	Associate	0309H0120: Research Infrastructure applications, identify, prep, and call Infrastructure Application Owners.	\$235.00	2.00	\$470.00	
4/22/2009	Alan L. Lai	Associate	0309H0121: Follow up e-mails to Infrastructure Application Owners.	\$235.00	0.80	\$188.00	

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/22/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0122: Update tracking database to document Card Services documentation received, new Infrastructure correspondence and documentation received.	\$235.00	0.70	\$164.50
4/22/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0123: Draft follow-up e-mail correspondence to Marketing and Card Services industry technology application owners.	\$380.00	2.30	\$874.00
4/22/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0124: Finalized and sent email to K. Knutson (WaMu) regarding Retail application communication to Application Owners and Hogan related applications.	\$425.00	0.30	\$127.50
4/22/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0125: Produce memo based on new materials from G. Duryee (WaMu).	\$425.00	0.40	\$170.00
4/22/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0126: Enter meeting notes from Jason Herres (WaMu) into the application tracking database.	\$425.00	0.80	\$340.00
4/22/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0127: Follow-up email to Jason Herres (WaMu).	\$425.00	0.10	\$42.50
4/22/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0128: Continue entering meeting notes from Jason Herres into the application tracking database.	\$425.00	1.20	\$510.00
4/22/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0129: Import 'last contact' into retail application database.	\$425.00	1.20	\$510.00
4/22/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0130: Draft and send emails to retail Application Owners.	\$425.00	2.80	\$1,190.00
4/23/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0131: Follow up e-mails, correspondence with Infrastructure application tech owners - set up meetings, and calls.	\$235.00	1.30	\$305.50
4/23/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0132: Update tracking database to document Infrastructure applications received, updated correspondence, and status.	\$235.00	1.30	\$305.50
4/23/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0133: Update application tracking database for Card Services, e-Commerce, Marketing and Infrastructure industry applications.	\$380.00	1.00	\$380.00

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation
4/23/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0134: Prepared list of retail applications completed for K. Knutson's (WaMu) review.	\$425.00	0.40	\$170.00
4/23/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0135: Draft and send emails to Retail Application Owners.	\$425.00	1.00	\$425.00
4/24/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0136: Set up meetings, calls with Infrastructure Application Owners, and additional e-mail follow up.	\$235.00	0.80	\$188.00
4/24/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0137: Update application tracking database for Card Services, and review of Card Services application documentation response received from L. Alatorre (WaMu).	\$380.00	1.30	\$494.00
4/24/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0138: Continue - Update application tracking database for Card Services, and review of Card Services application documentation response received from L. Alatorre (WaMu).	\$380.00	1.00	\$380.00
4/24/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0139: Draft e-mail response to L. Alatorre (WaMu) requesting additional information for specific Card Services industry applications.	\$380.00	1.80	\$684.00
4/27/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0140: Follow up e-mails to Infrastructure Application Owners, check past correspondence, update status on recent correspondence, and review memos.	\$235.00	0.70	\$164.50
4/27/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0141: Review of application documentation memorandums for Card Services industry applications.	\$380.00	0.50	\$190.00
4/27/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0142: Draft and send Information Request emails to Retail Application Owners.	\$425.00	3.90	\$1,657.50
4/27/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0143: Continue - Draft and send Information Request emails to Retail Application Owners.	\$425.00	2.20	\$935.00
4/27/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0144: Finish draft and send Information Request emails to Retail Application Owners.	\$425.00	2.20	\$935.00

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/28/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0145: Follow up e-mails to Infrastructure Application Owners, check past correspondence, update status on recent correspondence, and review memos.	\$235.00	0.30	\$70.50
4/28/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0146: Perform reconciliation on new Card Services documentation uploaded against what was previously uploaded. Pull down new files, and update tracking database.	\$235.00	0.80	\$188.00
4/28/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0147: Update application tracking database for Retail industry applications.	\$380.00	0.50	\$190.00
4/28/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0148: Update application tracking database for Retail, Infrastructure and Card Services industry applications.	\$380.00	3.00	\$1,140.00
4/29/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0149: Follow up e-mails to Infrastructure Application Owners.	\$235.00	0.20	\$47.00
4/29/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0150: Research Infrastructure applications, call Infrastructure application owners to request information.	\$235.00	0.90	\$211.50
4/29/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0151: Update application tracking database for Retail, Infrastructure and Card Services industry applications.	\$380.00	1.50	\$570.00
4/29/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0152: Draft application data flow chart and preservation reasoning for key applications in Card Services industry.	\$380.00	3.10	\$1,178.00
4/29/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0153: Continue - Draft application data flow chart and preservation reasoning for key applications in Card Services industry.	\$380.00	1.00	\$380.00
4/29/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0154: Add field and perform maintenance on Application Tracking Spreadsheet.	\$425.00	0.50	\$212.50
4/29/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0155: Working on redefinition of Tiers.	\$425.00	0.70	\$297.50
4/29/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0156: Finalize and Send Hogan related Retail Application Information request and Meeting Followup email.	\$425.00	1.00	\$425.00

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation	Total
4/29/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0157: Creation of Retail Data Flow diagram.	\$425.00	2.70	\$1,147.50	
4/30/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0158: Follow up calls, and e-mails to Infrastructure Application Owners for status updates on information requests.	\$235.00	0.40	\$94.00	
4/30/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0159: Draft application data flow chart and preservation reasoning for key applications in Card Services industry.	\$380.00	2.00	\$760.00	
4/30/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0160: Draft e-mail to G. Pugh (WaMu) to discuss request for information for Infrastructure industry applications.	\$380.00	0.50	\$190.00	
4/30/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0161: Draft application data flow chart and preservation reasoning for key applications in Card Services industry; update application tracking database for Retail, Infrastructure and Card Services industry applications.	\$380.00	1.20	\$456.00	
4/30/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0162: Draft e-mail to T. Langenkamp (A&M) to discuss data extract from Active Directory server.	\$380.00	0.40	\$152.00	
4/30/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0163: Continue - Draft application data flow chart and preservation reasoning for key applications in Card Services industry; update application tracking database for Retail, Infrastructure and Card Services industry applications.	\$380.00	2.30	\$874.00	
Total Hours and Compensation for 02_Identify/Obtain/Process of Electronic Stored Information				124.00	\$47,274.50		
03_Review of Electronic Stored Information							
4/1/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0164: Review Commercial industry documentation provided by WaMu and update application tracking database.	\$380.00	1.60	\$608.00	
4/1/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0165: Card Services interviews - consolidate notes and documentation into one data source for further review - summary sheet for ~200 applications.	\$235.00	2.00	\$470.00	

WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation	Total
4/1/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0166: Card Services interviews - consolidate notes and documentation into one data source for further review - summary sheet for ~200 applications.	\$235.00	3.60	\$846.00	
4/1/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0167: Continue Card Services interviews - consolidate notes and documentation into one data source for further review - summary sheet for ~200 applications.	\$235.00	2.80	\$658.00	
4/1/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0168: Wrap up Card Services interviews - consolidate notes and documentation into one data source for further review - summary sheet for ~200 applications.	\$235.00	2.00	\$470.00	
4/1/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0169: Review of Card Services industry application documentation uploaded to WaMu Data Exchange website.	\$380.00	0.50	\$190.00	
4/1/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0170: Review of Infrastructure industry application documentation memorandums to file for purposes of classifying and prioritizing applications.	\$380.00	1.80	\$684.00	
4/1/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0171: Continue - Review of Infrastructure industry application documentation memorandums to file for purposes of classifying and prioritizing applications.	\$380.00	3.10	\$1,178.00	
4/1/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0172: Review of Retail industry application documentation memorandums to file for purposes of classifying and prioritizing applications.	\$380.00	2.30	\$874.00	
4/1/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0173: Review of Infrastructure Application Memos.	\$425.00	2.30	\$977.50	
4/1/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0174: Update the Tracking Database with latest Application Statuses.	\$425.00	1.00	\$425.00	
4/1/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0175: Reconciliation of Infrastructure Application memos.	\$425.00	1.50	\$637.50	
4/1/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0176: Review of Infrastructure Application Memos.	\$425.00	2.80	\$1,190.00	
4/2/2009	David L. Marston	Partner	0309H0177: Review Documents.	\$675.00	1.50	\$1,012.50	

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation
4/2/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0178: Card Services interviews - consolidate notes and documentation into one data source for further review - summary sheet for ~200 applications.	\$235.00	1.00	\$235.00
4/2/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0179: Meeting with A. Lai (PwC) to discuss documentation and memos for Card Services industry.	\$380.00	0.80	\$304.00
4/2/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0180: Meeting with C. Nakagaki (PwC) to discuss documentation and memos for Card Services industry.	\$235.00	0.80	\$188.00
4/2/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0181: Meeting with C. Nakagaki and A. Lai (PwC) to discuss status of Card Services industry.	\$425.00	1.00	\$425.00
4/2/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0182: Meeting with W. Conolly and A. Lai (PwC) to discuss status of Card Services industry.	\$380.00	1.00	\$380.00
4/2/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0183: Meeting with C. Nakagaki, W. Conolly (PwC) to discuss status of Card Services industry.	\$235.00	1.00	\$235.00
4/2/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0184: Continue Card Services interviews - consolidate notes and documentation into one data source for further review - summary sheet for ~200 applications.	\$235.00	0.60	\$141.00
4/2/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0185: Perform reconciliation between data sources received for Card Services.	\$235.00	1.80	\$423.00
4/2/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0186: Write memos for Card Services applications to document what each application does, data structures, where data is stored, and how it interacts with the business.	\$235.00	3.70	\$869.50
4/2/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0187: Review of Card Services industry application documentation uploaded to WaMu Data Exchange website.	\$380.00	1.60	\$608.00
4/2/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0188: Update application tracking database for Card Services applications, reconcile Card Services application listing prepared for FDIC against QuickView listing.	\$380.00	4.00	\$1,520.00
4/2/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0189: Revision to the Tracking database and updates to version 1.24.	\$425.00	2.50	\$1,062.50

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/2/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0190: Revision of Tiers and Binder complete Statuses in Tracking Database and uploading of documents to Sharepoint site.	\$425.00	3.80	\$1,615.00
4/2/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0191: Review of Infrastructure Application Memos.	\$425.00	1.80	\$765.00
4/3/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0192: Update tier for commercial applications based on review of documentation provided by WaMu.	\$380.00	3.50	\$1,330.00
4/3/2009	Alan L. Lai	Associate	0309H0193: Continue to write memos for Card Services applications to document what each application does, data structures, where data is stored, and how it interacts with the business.	\$235.00	2.80	\$658.00
4/3/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0194: Review of application information received from Card Services contacts (M. Heer, and W. Anderson).	\$380.00	3.60	\$1,368.00
4/6/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0195: Meeting with D. Griffith (A&M) to perform gap analysis on JPMC financial data archival requirements versus WMI requirements.	\$380.00	1.80	\$684.00
4/6/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0196: Meeting with D. Griffith, B. Beake (A&M) to review the preservation requirements for Corp Services applications.	\$380.00	1.30	\$494.00
4/6/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0197: Update commercial applications in application tracking database.	\$380.00	0.60	\$228.00
4/6/2009	Alan L. Lai	Associate	0309H0198: Write memos for Card Services applications to document what each application does, data structures, where data is stored, and how it interacts with the business.	\$235.00	4.00	\$940.00
4/6/2009	Alan L. Lai	Associate	0309H0199: Continue Write memos for Card Services applications to document what each application does, data structures, where data is stored, and how it interacts with the business.	\$235.00	3.70	\$869.50
4/6/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0200: Update application tracking database for Card Services applications.	\$380.00	0.50	\$190.00

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/6/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0201: Review of application information received from Card Services contacts (M. Heer, and W. Anderson).	\$380.00	1.80	\$684.00
4/6/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0202: Review of application documentation memorandums for Card Services industry applications.	\$380.00	1.00	\$380.00
4/6/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0203: Continue - Review of application information received from Card Services contacts (M. Heer, and W. Anderson).	\$380.00	1.80	\$684.00
4/6/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0204: Update Tracking Database with latest Application Statuses, (i.e., Binder Complete, documentation received, etc.).	\$425.00	2.20	\$935.00
4/6/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0205: Final Review of Infrastructure Memos - Email memos to B. Vanderbush for Review.	\$425.00	2.50	\$1,062.50
4/7/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0206: Update preservation tiers for Commercial and Home Loans applications.	\$380.00	3.30	\$1,254.00
4/7/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0207: Continue to update preservation tiers for Commercial and Home Loans applications.	\$380.00	0.90	\$342.00
4/7/2009	Alan L. Lai	Associate	0309H0208: Write memos for Card Services applications to document what each application does, data structures, where data is stored, and how it interacts with the business.	\$235.00	3.50	\$822.50
4/7/2009	Alan L. Lai	Associate	0309H0209: Continue to write memos for Card Services applications to document what each application does, data structures, where data is stored, and how it interacts with the business.	\$235.00	2.30	\$540.50
4/7/2009	Alan L. Lai	Associate	0309H0210: Review memos for Card Services applications to document what each application does, data structures, where data is stored, and how it interacts with the business.	\$235.00	3.30	\$775.50
4/7/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0211: Review of application information received from Card Services contacts (M. Heer, and W. Anderson).	\$380.00	3.10	\$1,178.00

**WASHINGTON MUTUAL, INC., et al (Case 08-12229)
 PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants
 Professional Services by Project and Date - Hourly Services
 For the Period April 1, 2009 through April 30, 2009**

Exhibit C

Date	Name	Position	Description	Rate	Hours	Compensation Total
4/7/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0212: Update application tracking database for Card Services applications.	\$380.00	0.80	\$304.00
4/7/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0213: Review status update presentation prepared for T. Langenkamp (A&M).	\$380.00	0.50	\$190.00
4/7/2009	Colin Matthew Nakagaki	Manager	0309H0214: Review and revise application documentation memorandums for Card Services industry applications, and update application tracking database for Card Services applications.	\$380.00	3.80	\$1,444.00
4/7/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0215: Send follow-up emails to Infrastructure and Retail Application Owners.	\$425.00	1.30	\$552.50
4/7/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0216: Creation and Review of Infrastructure Application Memos.	\$425.00	1.80	\$765.00
4/7/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0217: Creation and Review of Infrastructure Application Memos and Received documentation.	\$425.00	1.50	\$637.50
4/7/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0218: Update application tracking database for Retail and Infrastructure applications.	\$425.00	0.80	\$340.00
4/7/2009	Walker P. Conolly	Manager	0309H0219: Review status update presentation prepared for T. Langenkamp (A&M).	\$425.00	1.10	\$467.50
4/8/2009	Aaron Michael Dickie	Manager	0309H0220: Review of Commercial Application documentation in preparation for meeting with Application Owners.	\$380.00	3.30	\$1,254.00
4/8/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0221: Write memos for Card Services applications to document what each application does, data structures, where data is stored, and how it interacts with the business.	\$235.00	3.70	\$869.50
4/8/2009	Alan L Lai	Associate	0309H0222: Continue to write memos for Card Services applications to document what each application does, data structures, where data is stored, and how it interacts with the business.	\$235.00	3.60	\$846.00