

EXHIBIT A

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/03/09	AMA	Meeting with D. Elsberg re case background (.5); review complaints (2.6).	3.10
04/03/09	DLE	Kickoff conference call with client, P. Calamari, M. Carlinsky, S. Kirpalani to discuss immediate projects, including preparation of presentation to Board this week (.7); meet with A. Abensohn, M. Longyear, E. Parness (.4); review key documents to prepare for team call tomorrow (2.3); list/identify key issues for Board presentation (.7).	4.10
04/03/09	EP	Meeting with D. Elsberg, A. Abensohn, and M. Longyear to discuss background and upcoming presentation to WMI Board (.4); review complaints filed in District of District of Columbia, Delaware Bankruptcy Court, and Texas State Court and background materials and memos (1.0); prepare analysis of various jurisdictional and bankruptcy issues (3.1).	4.50
04/03/09	HLD	Emails with B. Rosen re QE retention issues and research re same (1.2); Emails with S. Kirpalani re next steps (.4); Emails with C. Clark and Weil re documents and coordinate related processing issues (1.8).	3.40
04/03/09	MBC	Review documents (1.2); prepare/meet to discuss strategy (.5); review complaint (.8).	2.50
04/03/09	MLX	Meet with PC, MBC, DE re: summary of status (.4); review Delaware complaint, D.C. complaint, and Galveston complaint (4.9).	5.30
04/03/09	PC	T.C C. Smith and R. Williams re: retention and staffing (1.0); create/structure litigation plan (.3); T.C. C. Smith re: projected work (.2).	1.50
04/03/09	SD	Prepare and assemble complaint for attorney review (1.0).	1.00
04/03/09	SK2	TC w/ B. Rosen re retention and next steps (.3); prepare for/attend conf. call w/ D. Elsberg, B. Rosen, C. Smith, R. Williams re protocol and staffing issues (.7) ; meeting w/ M. Carlinsky, P. Calamari, D. Elsberg re initial strategy and working groups (.5).	1.50
04/04/09	AMA	Research re jurisdiction as to pending litigation (5.1); research re possible additional causes of action (6.2).	11.30

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/04/09	DLE	Teleconf S. Kirpalani re next steps and tasks for associate team (.6); draft task list for associate team, distribute to team, teleconf with team to discuss tasks and next steps (.8); follow up calls with team members to answer questions (.9); review and outline DE complaint, DC complaint, TX complaint, P&A Agreement (4.2); draft internal QE list of legal issues, fact issues, forum issues, strategy options (5.1).	11.60
04/04/09	EP	Morning Teleconferences with D. Elsberg to discuss background issues and case and beginning research topics concerning jurisdiction and bankruptcy issues (1.4); review and analyze complaint filed against JPMC in Texas state court (5.6); create rider for chronology (1.7); review and edit summary document created by A. Abensohn compiling summaries of memos and chronology of key events (.5).	9.20
04/04/09	MLX	Draft summaries of DE and DC complaints (6); draft cast of characters (1.4); conference calls with team re: same (.8); legal research re: jurisdiction; TX action (3).	11.20
04/04/09	PC	Continue review and revision of Board Presentation, comments from C. Smith, emails and telephone conferences Internal team, C. Smith and B. Rosen re: same, work on strategy re: response to JPMC Complaint (1.8); Further review Boli/Coli issues, emails D. Brown re: same (.3); Review Kasowitz Rule 2004 discovery request and emails re: same (.3); Emails re: documents on deposit issues (.3).	2.70
04/04/09	SK2	Review task list prepared by associates and complete same (.7); TC w/ D. Elsberg re overview of potential bankruptcy claims (.6).	1.30
04/05/09	AMA	Draft memo re case background (3.4); research re jurisdiction and claims (6.7); draft memo re same (2.7).	12.80
04/05/09	DLE	Teleconf client and Weil Gotshal re key issues and next steps (1.8); draft notes of call and circulate to QE team; revise issues and research list, circulate to QE team (.6); teleconf S. Kirpalani re key issues and strategy (.2); review binder of documents received from Weil (.4); confer associate team re research tasks being done today and re next steps (.4); revise chronology and summaries of contracts; review confidentiality agreement referenced in TX complaint (4.9).	8.30

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/05/09	EP	Teleconferences to discuss tasks and review of memo (.5); review and analyze Purchase and Assumption Agreement between FDIC and JPMC and draft memo outlining same (1.3).	1.80
04/05/09	HLD	Draft/revise initial S. Kirpalani declaration, emails re same with QE team (3.4); review conflicts re same (3.1); coordinate processing of documents from Weil (.7).	7.20
04/05/09	MLX	Legal research re: jurisdictional issues, TX action and draft memoranda re: same (10.8); C.C. with E. Parness re: issues in same (1).	11.80
04/05/09	PC	Final review of Draft Board Presentation, review comments from B. Rosen and S. Kirpalani, emails re: same (2.2); review Turnover Complaint draft and comment (.5).	2.70
04/05/09	SK2	Review binder re WMI deposit claims vs. WMB and FSB (2.6); TC w/ D. Elsberg re tasks (.2); conf. call w/ B. Kastoris, P. Calamari, D. Elsberg, C. Smith, B. Rosen re litigation background and options (1.5).	4.30
04/06/09	AMA	Legal research (6.3); memo regarding assorted issues raised in pending complaints, including intervention, and jurisdiction (4.4).	10.70
04/06/09	BF1	T.c. re: litigation options (.5); legal research re: jurisdictional issues (4.5).	5.00
04/06/09	CC4	Draft/prepare email to team regarding timekeeper issues (.5) Review emails and memos regarding case background. (.7).	1.20
04/06/09	DKB	Review case background materials (1.1); meeting with Weil attorneys to discuss case background (5); prepare for and participate on call regarding recovery schedule (1.2); review emails (.7).	8.00

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/06/09	DLE	Meet with Weil Gotshal re key issues (5.0); teleconf client and Weil re Recovery Analysis (participated in only a portion of the call) (.70); review draft chronology of facts and draft summaries of complaints (.7); review draft research memos on jurisdictional issues (.8); review materials received today from Weil Gotshal (1); outline possible topics and organization for Board presentation (.6); review decision issued today by federal court in Brooklyn staying case against WaMu based on FDIC stay and venue provisions, circulate same to QE team and to Weil (.3); teleconf re jurisdictional and venue questions (.4).	9.50
04/06/09	EP	Review confidentiality agreement between JPMC and WMI and draft memo highlighting key provisions (1.6); meeting with M. Longyear to discuss jurisdictional and venue research issues (.3); analysis of JPMC's motion to intervene in Delaware action (.2); conf. with M. Longyear regarding legal research (.3); research case law regarding elements of potential causes of action (2.2).	4.60
04/06/09	HLD	Review open case issues, coordinate and oversee binders and war room, confs with QE team re same (2.6); TCs/emails with Salpeika (Weil) re drafts of QE retention application and initial S. Kirpalani declaration (.6); Draft/revise same (3.9); review/revise summary chart for supplemental S. Kirpalani declaration (4.2).	11.30
04/06/09	JAA	Review complaints (1.5); research re:same (1.3); research on opposition to JP Morgan's Motion for Intervention (2.1); draft memo on opposition to motion to intervene (.9); read and summarize relevant caselaw re open statutory issues (.6).	6.40
04/06/09	MBC	Read relevant documents (1.2); telephone calls with team (.4); review memos re potential claims (1.6).	3.20
04/06/09	MLX	Meet with E. Parness re: research (.6); legal research and draft memoranda re: jurisdictional issues and issues re Texas action (9.8).	10.40

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/06/09	PC	Review JPMC NDA (.3); Emails re: extension of time to file Motion to Intervene (.2); Prepare for/meeting at Weil to review background of deposit and tax refund issues (5.0); emails C. Smith re: strategy and misc. issues (.3); TC C. Smith, Goulding and Quinn Team re: recovery analysis (1); Emails re: scheduling creditor's counsel meeting (.2); review press coverage of other claims and complaints (.3).	7.30
04/06/09	RN	Emails to D. Elsberg regarding press release, review briefs regarding USDC-EDNY regarding Washington Mutual (.1); instructions to M. Martinez (.1); follow up brief to D. Elsberg (.1).	0.30
04/06/09	SK2	Attend meeting at Weil with A. Stochak. B. Rosen, M. Goldstein, P. Calamari, D. Brown, D. Elsberg re strategic considerations (3.5); attend conf. call w/ clients re status (.7); review documents supporting complaint pending against FDIC (2.2).	6.40
04/07/09	AMA	Research re claims and defenses (4.1); draft power point presentation for Board (5.1).	9.20
04/07/09	BF1	Finalize research on motion to withdraw reference and draft memo re: same (4.3); review DE and DC complaint (1.8); prepare presentation on analyses of claims (4.1).	10.20
04/07/09	CC4	Organize storage and reproduction of documents produced to date (1.0).	1.00
04/07/09	DKB	Prepare for and attend meeting with Weil regarding case background (4.3); confer with D. Elsberg regarding board presentation (.5); participate on conference call regarding ERISA issues (1.0); summarize notes from meeting with Weil (.9).	6.70
04/07/09	DLE	Meet at Weil to get download on key issues (4.3); confer with D. Brown re draft Board Presentation, prepare outline of topics re same (0.5); review notes from Weil download sessions, review materials received from Weil, outline open issue for follow up inquiries and research (2.3); review research and articles including jurisdictional issues (.8); review memo from Weil re jurisdictional issues (0.4).	8.30

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/07/09	EP	Continue research on remedies (.4); correspondence with D. Elsberg , A.Abensohn, and M. Lacroix regarding maintenance of chron file for documents filed, as well as other key documents (. 4); research regarding timing of answer or motion to dismiss and timing of reply to JPMC's motion to intervene (1.5).	2.30
04/07/09	HLD	Draft/revise finalize QE retention application and initial S. Kirpalani declaration (4.1); TCs/emails with Salpeika (Weil) re finalizing and filing same (.7); Emails with C. Clark re binders and war room (.4); Review conflicts results for supplemental S. Kirpalani declaration (5.0); draft/revise summary chart of same, emails with S. Kirpalani and J. Tecce re same (1.9).	12.10
04/07/09	JAA	Review FDIC's proof of claims against WMI.	0.90
04/07/09	JCT	Review and revise retention application and declaration (.8); emails w/ S. Kirpalani and confs w/ H. Denman (.4).	1.20
04/07/09	MBC	Review materials (.3); participate on multiple calls (.4); review FDIC action (1.3).	2.00
04/07/09	ML4	Organize/process new matter folders.	0.90
04/07/09	MLX	Legal research re: jurisdiction, potential defenses (8.1); summarize DE complaint (1.3); prepare slides for presentation to board of directors (3).	12.40
04/07/09	PC	Attention to scheduling of Motion to Intervene (.2); Emails re: scheduling and conference calls (.2); Emails re: tax issue defense (.2); Review relevant caselaw (.2); Emails M. Carlinsky re: strategic alternatives (.2); work on outline for board prep, internal conference call re: same (1.8); T.C. C. Smith (.2); CC Goulding and others re: issues (.9); provide information for and review pro hac vice motions (.3).	4.20
04/07/09	SK2	Attend meeting at Weil with D. Elsberg, D. Brown, B. Rosen, A. Stochak, others re overview of claims and continue development of factual chronology, theories (4.5); outline possible litigation outcomes (1.9); review documentation in support of potential claims (2.7); review documents in support of potential claims (2.3).	11.40
04/08/09	AMA	Call with Weil re jurisdiction issues (.6); team meeting re case tasks (.5); revisions to board presentation (3.1); research re claims and defenses (3.1).	7.30

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/08/09	BF1	Further drafting, revising strategy memo (2.4); review of Debtors (.7).	3.10
04/08/09	DKB	Review and revise presentation to board (2.6); team meeting regarding outstanding projects (.4); participate in conference call regarding tax issues (1.2); confer with D. Elsborg regarding board presentation (.6); revise board presentation (6.2).	11.00
04/08/09	DLE	Review recent court decision (0.2); confer with team re Board Presentation (0.8); prepare for and conduct weekly internal QE team meeting to review tasks and upcoming events and overview of case, draft list of immediate tasks to review with group (0.4); teleconf B. Pedersen re tax issues raised by JPMC complaint (1.0); revise team task and deadline list (0.3); draft and edit Board presentation, confer re same and give comments to D. Brown (2.1); review FDIC's papers in support of motion to transfer, and list related research tasks (0.4); teleconf Weil re related FDIC issues (0.6).	5.80
04/08/09	EP	Met with M. Lacroix regarding working group list and arranging chron of correspondence and filings (.3); review other confidentiality agreements (.4); team meeting to discuss various administrative tasks (.5).	1.20
04/08/09	MBC	Participate in team meetings via conference calls, review emails re same (2.0); review C. Smith memo re allegations (.4).	2.40
04/08/09	ML4	Meeting with E. Parness re case status (.3); Retrieve/upload pleadings on the S drive (1.6).	1.90
04/08/09	MLX	C.C. with Weil re: jurisdiction (.6); WMI team meeting (.4); review and revise slide presentation to board (2); legal research re: jurisdiction, procedure and claims issues (7.4).	10.40

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/08/09	PC	Emails re: document retention notices (.2); Review FDIC Motion (.3); Review Weil draft response and emails re: same (.2); Review Weil memo on jurisdiction issues (.2); Review chronology prepared by Weil (.2); Meeting with Creditors Committee at Weil and prepare for same and emails re: same (3.5); Review letter from shareholder and emails re: possible response (.3); Review stipulation re: service on FDIC and emails re: same (.3); emails re: scheduling and tasks (.1); review documents re: potential claim and cc Pederson re: same (1.4).	6.70
04/08/09	RHP	Review draft complaint for turnover (.3).	0.30
04/08/09	SK2	Attend meeting at Akin with F. Hodara, R. Johnson, D. Simonds, P. Calamari, A. Scruton, Kasowitz firm, White & Case firm, B. Pfeiffer (Fried Frank) re division of responsibility, strategic litigation issues (2.2); follow up meeting w/ F. Hodara, R. Johnson, A. Scruton re issues (.5).	2.70
04/09/09	AMA	Call with Weil re document retention (.4); draft document retention notice (1.1); research re claims and defenses (4.1).	5.60
04/09/09	BF1	Research re: potential claim (2.8); revise slides re: (1.5).	4.30
04/09/09	DKB	Call with Adam Strochak regarding document collection (.4); confer with D. Elsberg and revise board presentation, reviewed legal issues re same (8.0).	8.40
04/09/09	DLE	Draft/revise Board presentation and confer with D. Brown re same (4.2); teleconf R. Williams, B. Rosen, C. Smith re status of case and next steps (1.1); analyze claims, review research from M. Longyear re same and discuss same with P. Calamari and emails re same with S. Kirpalani and M. Carlinsky (1).	6.30
04/09/09	EP	Research status of Texas action (0.8); review relevant procedural rules re same (1.4); research re FDIC's motion (1.3).	3.50
04/09/09	MBC	Status call with C. Smith, B. Rosen and others (.3); review memos re counterclaims (2.2).	2.50
04/09/09	ML4	Create tax related document binder for D. Brown (.6); Process/review correspondence and pleadings (1.2).	1.80

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/09/09	MLX	Review and revise slide presentation to board presentation (1); legal research re: counterclaims, related legal issues and draft memo re: same (7.6).	8.60
04/09/09	PC	Emails re: meeting and conference schedules (.2); review C. Smith comments on JPMC Complaint (.5); TC B. Rosen re: open issues and attend meeting re: same (3.2); Routine status conference call (1.1); review various documents, JPMC information sharing agreement, stipulation for FDIC (.5); tc D. Elsberg and review memos and emails re: legal and fact research issues (1.7).	7.20
04/09/09	RHP	Research re tax refund and related issues.	3.70
04/10/09	AMA	Team meeting (.8); review board presentation (.9); research re FDIC claims and defenses (2.5).	4.20
04/10/09	BF1	Research/create/revise slide for Board presentation (1.7); review/edit current version of presentation (1.5); review of deposit account stipulation (1.5); attend team strategy meeting (.8); C.C. with D Elsberg, R Parker (.5); TC with D Elsberg re: turnover complaint (.5); TC with H Denman re: turnover complaint (.5).	7.00
04/10/09	CC4	Team conf. regarding status of action.	0.70
04/10/09	DKB	Revise board presentation (5.3); confer with D. Elsberg regarding same (1.4).	6.70
04/10/09	DLE	Confer with P. Calamari re draft Board Presentation (0.4); edit draft Board Presentation, confer re same with D. Brown and B. Finestone (3.1); meet with P. Calamari to discuss Board presentation and edits to draft, and revise draft (1.7); follow up meeting with B. Finestone re weekend projects; follow up meeting with B. Finestone re Turnover issues (1.8); receive/review comments from client re draft Board presentation, revise draft per client comments (1.7); review DE, TX and DC complaints and review client documents (2.5).	11.20
04/10/09	EP	Team meeting to discuss Board presentation, answer, counterclaims, and turnover proceeding (.8); review current draft of Board presentation (.3); research case law on potential claims (.5).	1.60

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/10/09	HLD	Confs with QE team re case status and next steps (.8); conf with B. Finestone re 2004 and turnover issues (.5); legal research re turnover issues, emails re same with B. Finestone (1.8).	3.10
04/10/09	MBC	Review memos re legal issues and claims issues (1.2); review fact memos (.6); review and revise board presentation (1.7); meet with team for update on presentation (.8); prepare strategy for proposal to board, creditor group, confer to discuss same (1.8).	6.10
04/10/09	ML4	Meeting with WMI team (.8); coordinate/process WMI pleading binder (1.1).	1.90
04/10/09	MLX	Legal research re: counterclaims and memo re: same (3.5); team meeting re: strategy (.7).	4.20
04/10/09	PC	Review and revise Board Presentation and meetings re: same (2.9); Review documents related to Boli Coli/Rabbi Trust issue, conference D. Elsberg re: same (.9); Internal meetings re: strategy (1.8); emails re: scheduling and court calendar (.2); attention to organization of Answer to Complaint in Delaware and emails re: same (.9); review draft turnover papers and draft Rule 2004 discovery request (.5).	7.20
04/10/09	RHP	Research re potential claims issues (1.3); draft memo to file (.4); confer with team re strategic considerations and task list (1.0); confer with B. Finestone re turnover action (.5).	3.20
04/11/09	AMA	Revisions to Board presentation (5.3).	5.30
04/11/09	BF1	C.C. with D Elsberg re: counterclaims and turnover action strategy (.5); draft turnover complaint (7.3).	7.80
04/11/09	DKB	Review materials for board presentation (1.9).	1.90
04/11/09	DLE	Draft Board Presentation (3.8), multiple conference calls (1.1) and emails with QE team re same (2.9).	7.80
04/11/09	EP	Received update from A. Abensohn on status of Board presentation.	0.10
04/11/09	HLD	Review of turnover issues and relevant law (.6); legal research re same (3.2); draft memo summary of same (1.3).	5.10

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/11/09	MBC	Conference calls (1.1); prepare board materials (.7); review memos re trust securities, deposits, legal issues (1.).	2.80
04/11/09	MLX	Legal research re: counterclaims (8.1); email to team re: same (1.1).	9.20
04/11/09	PC	Work on outline of tasks and email Quinn team and C. Smith re: same (1.8); Emails and telephone conferences Quinn team re: strategy (.4).	2.20
04/11/09	RHP	Draft memo to file re turnover claim for disputed tax refund (1.0); review and revise same (1.1); Review draft 2004 motion and document requests (.9).	3.00
04/12/09	AMA	Review/revise Board presentation; tc/emails re same.	8.20
04/12/09	BF1	Draft/revise turnover complaint.	4.10
04/12/09	DLE	Draft Board Presentation.	4.30
04/12/09	EP	Proofread and edit Board Presentation (1.6); review/draft 2004 discovery requests (.8).	2.40
04/12/09	HLD	Review rule 2004 issues with R. Parker (.5); review Texas complaint and summary of same (1.1); Prepare/revise rule 2004 motion re same (3.8).	5.40
04/12/09	MBC	Review and edit board presentation (.6); review memorandum re trust securities (.6).	1.20
04/12/09	MLX	Review and revise slides for WMI board presentation.	1.10
04/12/09	PC	T.C. C. Smith, R. Williams, W. Kosturos, B. Rosen and Quinn team re: status and background (1.8); Review various documents, draft turnover complaint, revise memo, recovery analysis, and research (1.6); reviewed emails and internal telephone conferences re: same (.7).	4.10
04/12/09	RHP	Confer with H. Denman re Rule 2004 requests (.4); review Galveston complaint and requests (1.4); review Rule 2004 draft requests (.5).	2.30
04/13/09	AMA	Revisions to board presentation (1.8); attend board presentation (1.8).	3.60
04/13/09	BF1	Revise turnover complaint in accord with team's comments (2.5); review final board presentation for crafting rule 2004 requests (1.1); begin draft rule 2004 motion (4.1).	7.70

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/13/09	DKB	Review emails (1.5); team meeting to prepare for board presentation (1.6); participate on call with board (2.1).	5.20
04/13/09	DLE	Meeting with creditors groups at Akin Gump to discuss draft of Answer to JPMC's complaint (4.6); prep session with M. Carlinsky, P. Calamari and D. Brown to prepare for presentation to the WMI Board (1.6); attend telephonic presentation to the Board (1.6); draft Answer to JPMC's complaint (1.7); review draft turnover complaint, correspond re same with S. Kirpalani, M. Carlinsky, P. Calamari (0.4).	9.90
04/13/09	EP	Correspondence with D. Elsberg regarding Board Presentation (.1), review draft turnover complaint (.5); organize pleadings with M. Lacroix (.1); review/revise presentation to Washington Mutual Board (1.9).	2.60
04/13/09	HLD	Draft/revise 2004 motion (3.1); confs/emails with B. Finestone and R. Parker re same (.8); review Texas complaint and related summaries, board presentations for same (1.4); review draft turnover complaint and email comments re same (.5).	5.80
04/13/09	MBC	Prepare for and attend meeting at Akin to draft answer (5.1); prepare for board meeting; review issues; attend board meeting (2.).	7.10
04/13/09	ML4	Create pleadings binder for WMI team (2.2); retrieve/organize pdfs of pleadings (3.6).	5.80
04/13/09	MLX	Legal research re: potential counterclaims (4.9); review and revise answer (4.9).	9.80
04/13/09	PC	Review and revise Turnover Complaint and emails re: same (.8); Review Rule 2004 request from creditors (.3); final comments on Board Presentation (.8); Meeting at Akin Gump to draft Complaint (attend by conf. call) (4.2); TC C. Smith re: status (.2); Emails re: stipulation denying FDIC Intervention (.2); Internal prep meeting with Quinn team for Board Meeting and to discuss strategy (1.5); Review documents re: Purchase Agreement (.2); Presentation to Board (2.0); emails C. Smith re: next steps (.1).	10.30
04/13/09	RHP	Confer with H. Denman re 2004 requests (.3); confer with B. Finestone re same (.2); review turnover motion (.4); review Delaware action (.5); draft 2004 requests (1.8); review and revise Rule 2004 motions (.3).	3.50

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/13/09	SK2	Revising complaint for turnover (2.5); confer w/ B. Finestone re comments (.7); review and finalize board of directors presentation (1.5); attend meeting at Akin to discuss draft Answer and strategy (2.8); TC w/ creditor re OTS issues (.8); prepare for call with board of directors (2.0); attend call with board, Weil, other QE attorneys to discuss status of review of claims and next steps (2.5).	12.80
04/14/09	AMA	Research re JPMC's motion to intervene (2.4).	2.40
04/14/09	BF1	Research re: 2004 motion (3.5); continue draft re same (6.6).	10.10
04/14/09	DLE	Search for and circulate press releases re open issues (0.7); status update call with R. Williams, Chad and others at WMI (0.8); teleconf creditors re litigation strategy going forward (0.5); draft Answer to JPMC's Delaware complaint (8.3); teleconf R. Johnson re draft Answer (0.2).	10.50
04/14/09	HLD	Emails with R. Parker re 2004 requests.	0.50
04/14/09	MBC	Review answer and provide comments (.5); weekly call and related emails (.6); review legal issues and related email to client and follow up call (2.4); review/revise 2004 papers (1.2); review research memos (1.0).	5.70
04/14/09	ML4	Create pleadings binder for DC action for WMI team.	2.40
04/14/09	MLX	Legal research re counterclaims (3.1); review and revise answer (8.8).	11.90
04/14/09	PC	Emails re: strategy issues (.2); review and comment on answer and emails re: same (.7); status conference call with WMI re: term sheet, emails re: same (.8); CC Aurelius re: same and numerous emails re: resulting strategy (1.8); emails re: FDIC deadline to file, document access from JPMC (.3).	3.80
04/14/09	RHP	Research re Rule 2004 requests (2.0); review adversary proceeding complaint (.5); review Washington DC complaint (.4); draft Rule 2004 requests (3.4); review and revise Rule 2004 motion (1.9).	8.20

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/14/09	SK2	Corresp. w/ D. Elsberg, P. Calamari re issues raised by individual creditors on strategy (.8); TC w/ D. Gropper re same (.5); TC w/ B. Pfeiffer re same (.5); TC w/ V. Melwani re same (.4); attend "all hands" creditor counsel call re answer deadline (.8); confer w/ B. Rosen, P. Calamari re results of same (.9).	3.90
04/15/09	AMA	Revisions to Answer to Complaint (3.2); research re intervention (1.4); review draft pleadings (.7).	5.30
04/15/09	BF1	Revise answer (.5); research re same (2.1); draft, revise and expand Rule 2004 motion (4.8); draft emergency pleading re: counterclaim issues (3.7); review JPMC proofs of claim for answer (.6).	11.70
04/15/09	DLE	Draft Answer, including revisions based on comments received from QE team (8.2); confer re same (0.4).	8.60
04/15/09	EP	Review and edited answer in Delaware action.	1.10
04/15/09	HLD	TCs/emails with B. Finestone re retention status and related issues (.4); Emails with Greenleaf re same (.3); review revised 2004 motion and emails re same (.4).	1.10
04/15/09	MBC	Review revised answer (.7); review term sheet and motion re opp to intervene (1.0); multiple calls with clients, creditors and team (2.4); review revised 2004 papers and issues re the motion (.7).	4.80
04/15/09	ML4	Process/organize proof of claim exhibits from Weil and JPMC (5.7).	5.70
04/15/09	MLX	Review and revise answer (2.1); draft motion re: amending counterclaims (3.1).	5.20
04/15/09	PC	Review and revise answer to Complaint, emails and conference D. Elsberg and C. Smith re: same (3.2); emails re: term sheet (.3); emails re: strategy on counterclaims, CC C. Smith and B. Rosen re: same, CC Sullivan and Cromwell re: possible extension, emails Creditors' counsel re: same (1.1); emails re: retention of local counsel (.2); Review and revise Rule 2004 request and emails re: same (1.3); review Turnover Petition (.2).	6.30
04/16/09	AMA	Research re intervention opposition.	1.80

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/16/09	BF1	Revise turnover complaint (2.5); C.C. with Committee counsel, S Kirpalani, H Denman re: counterclaims (.7); review of Creditors' Committee litigation theories (1.8); research tax issues (3.2); draft memo on same (4.8).	13.00
04/16/09	DKB	Prepare for and participate on tax update call with Curt Brouwer (.7); review document preservation notice and related emails (.6).	1.30
04/16/09	DLE	Revise Answer and collect comments on same (2.1); update conference call with R. Williams, B. Rosen and others (0.6); confer re document preservation (0.2); review draft opposition to motion to intervene (0.3); review turnover r draft and 2004 discovery draft (0.4).	3.60
04/16/09	EP	Correspond with M. Lacroix for chron file.	0.10
04/16/09	HLD	Attend conf call with B. Finestone with creditors committee re potential claims strategy (.7); review memo on claims re same (.4).	1.10
04/16/09	MBC	Weekly call (1.0); multiple emails to discuss strategy; including telephone calls (1.8); conference call with clients (1.5); calls with S&C (.2); review 2004 motion and issues (.50); review opp brief re intervene (.50); review turnover action (1.2).	6.70
04/16/09	ML4	Retrieve/organize proofs of claim received from JPMC and WMI (3.1); create pleadings binder for DC Action (2.8).	5.90
04/16/09	MLX	Review and revise answer (.6).	0.60
04/16/09	PC	Additional comments to answer, turnover and Rule 2004 drafts, circulate to creditors (1.8); draft Complaint against JPMC (.6); Routine conf. call re: status, stipulation re: time, strategy (.5); Review and comment on opposition to intervention motion, comments and emails re: same (1.0); Conf. call C. Brown re: tax issues, review memo on legal conclusions re: same (.8); Review term sheet, emails re: same and re: cover note (.3); emails re: scheduling various meetings and calls (.2); TC C. Smith, R. Williams re: answer and counterclaim deadlines, email creditors committee re: same (.7).	5.90

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/16/09	SK2	Attend conf. call regarding litigation w/ P. Calamari, M. Carlinsky, C. Smith (1.1); attend conf. call w/ D. Simonds, others at Akin, B. Finestone re claims (.7); review TruPS documentation and chronology regarding issuance and purported contribution (3.5); attend call w/ C. Smith, M. Carlinsky, B. Rosen (1.5).	6.80
04/17/09	AMA	Attend team meeting re counterclaims (1.0); research re intervention (2.7); revisions to Answer (.8).	4.50
04/17/09	BF1	TC with M Carlinsky, P Calamari, D Elsberg, S Kirpalani, D Brown, A Abensohn re: counterclaims and answer (1); coordinate with N Lapinski re scheduling concerns (1.1); draft stip extending time to answer complaint and revise in accord with creditor comments (2.1); correspondence with S Kirpalani re: strategy issues (.3).	4.50
04/17/09	DKB	Team meeting regarding possible counterclaims and prepare same.	1.20
04/17/09	DLE	QE team meeting re draft claims, counterclaims and next steps (1.2); teleconf R. Johnson at Akin re Answer and counterclaims (0.3); review redacted FOIA documents (0.2).	1.70
04/17/09	HLD	Draft/revise research memo for QE team re claims (2.4); legal research re same (3.4); review/research filings and relevant documents for same (2.3).	8.10
04/17/09	MBC	Call re insurance claims (.50); meet with team re counterclaims; review issues re counterclaims; calls with Sullivan & Cromwell re stipulation; calls with creditors counsel (2.5).	3.00
04/17/09	ML4	Prepare research memo binders for team (4.1); update pleadings binder (3.8).	7.90
04/17/09	MLX	Legal research re: potential counterclaims.	4.80

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/17/09	PC	Emails re: Motion to Amend Caption (.1); emails and TC's re: scheduling issues re: time to answer, counterclaim, review stipulation and revise (.8); internal conference re: strategy for counterclaim (.8); review pro hac vice applications (.1); emails re: FOIA request redactions (.2); emails re: scheduling on opposition to Motion to Intervene (.1); efforts to retain local counsel and emails re: same (.4); comments on answer and emails re: same (.4); emails re: D & O coverage (.4).	3.30
04/17/09	SK2	Review P&A Agreement (.9); draft talking points re same (.5); attend meeting w/ M. Carlinsky, D. Elsberg, D. Brown, A. Abensohn, B. Finestone re possible counterclaims (1.2); attend conf. call re insurance issues (.5); review policy language issues (.6).	3.70
04/18/09	EP	Research caselaw on potential claims.	0.50
04/18/09	PC	Emails re: comments to answer (.2); emails re: scheduling (.1); emails re: stipulation on time to answer (.3).	0.60
04/19/09	BF1	Revise turnover complaint further in accord with C Smith comments.	3.70
04/19/09	DLE	Review comments sent from C. Smith to P. Calamari re Answer and re turnover draft (.4).	0.40
04/19/09	PC	Comments on answer to complaint and emails re: same (.4); review C. Smith comments re: turnover proceeding and emails re: same (.3).	0.70
04/20/09	AMA	Research re claims (4.3); draft memo summarizing claims (2.8).	7.10
04/20/09	BF1	Revise 2004 motion in accord with internal comments (1.5); revise turnover complaint (2.1); coordinate with Elliot Greenleaf and JPMC DE counsel to file extension (1.7); t.c. with B Pfeifer re: timing of stipulation filing (.2); t.c. with R Johnson re: timing of stipulation filing (.1); draft counterclaims analyses (4.1).	9.70
04/20/09	DLE	Confer with P. Calamari re claims outline (0.5); prepare for meeting with client (1.8); correspond and teleconf with Weil re pro hac motions and ECF (0.2).	2.50
04/20/09	EP	Research additional caselaw on potential claims (1.0); draft sections of outline of potential counterclaims and factual basis for those claims (2.4).	3.40

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/20/09	MBC	Review emails re issues; review list of claims (.5).	0.50
04/20/09	MLX	Legal research and draft summary of potential counterclaims (4.1).	4.10
04/20/09	PC	Emails re: 401k plan issue (.2); emails re: scheduling (.2); emails C. Smith, B. Finestone re: stipulation extending time (.3); review questions re: factual allegations in Complaint (.2); final review motion and emails re: same (.2); emails C. Smith, R. Williams re: status and scheduling, D. Elsberg re: outlining claims (.8); attention to pro hac applications, web registration (.2); comments on turnover action (.3).	2.40
04/20/09	RN	Emails regarding transcript; instructions to Mado Martinez/other (.2). Emails D. Elsberg /Peter regarding ECF in D.C./follow-up (.3).	0.50
04/20/09	SK2	TC w/ B. Pfeiffer (Fried Frank) re potential counterclaim issues (.5); review cases regarding contribution issues (1.5); review cases relating to potential setoff arguments (.9).	2.90
04/21/09	AMA	Call with Weil (.8); draft memo re JPMC's claims (5.3); draft memo re possible counterclaims (5.7).	11.80
04/21/09	BF1	C.C. with A Stochak, J Wine, Marshall @ Weil, A Abensohn, R Parker re: comments to various pleadings (1); C.C. with D Elsberg re: certain factual issues (.6); revise turnover complaint in accord with Weil, others' comments (4.5); counterclaims analyses (7.5); TC with R Parker re: assessment of JPMC claims (.9); t.c. with B Rothschild re: potential claim (.3).	14.80
04/21/09	DKB	Review D.C. and Delaware pleadings.	3.40
04/21/09	DLE	Prepare for meeting with client, review binder of documents and outline chronology re transfer of deposit funds (.7); confer with B. Finestone re same (0.6); teleconf Pepper Hamilton re FOIA requests to OTS and to FDIC, take and circulate notes re same and re next steps (0.4).	1.70
04/21/09	EP	Correspondence regarding FOIA requests to FDIC and OTS (.2); research regarding FOIA requests to FDIC and OTS (1.0).	1.20
04/21/09	HLD	Draft/revise supplemental S. Kirpalani declaration.	0.40

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/21/09	MBC	Review and revise legal papers (1.2); prepare for client meeting (.50); review emails re numerous issues/strategies (1.0).	2.70
04/21/09	ML4	Create/circulate pleadings binder of TX action for team.	2.60
04/21/09	MLX	Legal research re: potential counterclaims (2.4); review and revise analysis memorandum of JPMC's claims and WMI's potential counterclaims (7.7).	10.10
04/21/09	PC	Emails and discussions with JPMC re: status, strategies and scheduling (.4); emails re: FOIA requests (.1); review and revise two drafts of Turnover Complaint (1.4); review issues for counterclaims and emails with D. Elsberg re: same (.2); review revisions to Answer and Rule 2004 requests (.4); attention to case assessment for board meeting, emails re: same, review same (.7); review notes from D. Logan interview, prepare for debrief session (.3).	3.50
04/21/09	RHP	TC with Weil, B. Finestone and A. Abensohn re counterclaims (.8); TC re: assessment of claims asserted in DE adversary proceeding (.9); review complaint (.5); research re turnover (1.0); draft memo to file re JPMC's claims in adversary proceeding (2.2); draft memo to file re WMI's counterclaims (1.8).	7.20
04/21/09	RN	Retrieve transcript (.1); instructions to M. Martinez (.2). DC ECF regarding D. Elsberg/P. Calamari (.1); Court notice re: 5/21 PC; Instructions to M. Martinez (.2).	0.60
04/21/09	SK2	Review chronology and underlying documents relative to seizure events (1.4); review next draft of turnover complaint (1.1).	2.50
04/22/09	AMA	Research re grounds to oppose intervention in DC Action (2.1), review proposed revisions to Answer (1.3); draft summary of claims and counter-claims (5.2).	8.60
04/22/09	BF1	TC with D Logan, S Smith, B Rosen, Q.E. team re: turnover complaint, rule 2004 and other litigation issues (4.9); C.C. with litigation team and Debtors re: same (1.7); email correspondence with D Logan re: turnover complaint (.3).	6.90
04/22/09	DKB	Prepare for and attend meetings at Weil (interview with Doreen Logan and update call) (7.0).	7.00

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/22/09	DLE	Draft outline of documents and questions re deposits for interview with D. Logan (2.7); interview D. Logan (with C. Smith) and conference call re strategy with client, at Weil (7); draft follow up lists and emails to C. Smith, D. Logan and Weil requesting information and documents for court papers (0.5); review comments from creditors on draft pleadings (0.4).	10.60
04/22/09	EP	Draft FOIA requests (2.1); review Galveston complaint and propose 2004 requests (3.2).	5.30
04/22/09	HLD	Review/revise supplemental S. Kirpalani declaration (1.9); review claims memo/outline (.9).	2.80
04/22/09	MBC	Meeting at Weil with Doreen Logan; discuss numerous issues for turnover proceeding (3.2); board call; review handouts (1.2); emails re creditors' position on 2004/other (.50).	4.90
04/22/09	ML4	Organize JPMC proof of claim for B. Finestone.	0.80
04/22/09	MLX	Legal research re: opposition to JPMC's Motion to Intervene (4.4); review and revise comprehensive claims analysis memorandum (4.4).	8.80
04/22/09	OMU	Review complaints/outlines/assessments of case.	2.50
04/22/09	PC	Meeting at Weil re: review assessment of claims document, debrief Doreen Logan, Conf. call WMI re: status and strategy (7.0); follow up on meeting, organize S/J motion for turnover, research on tax issues; and emails D. Elsberg and team re: same (.8); review draft minutes of 4/13 meeting (.1).	7.90
04/22/09	RHP	Review strategic memos re claims and counterclaims in adversary proceeding (.7).	0.70
04/22/09	SK2	Attend portions of meeting w/ C. Smith, P. Calamari, B. Finestone, D. Brown, D. Elsberg, B. Rosen re interview w/ D. Logan and circumstances of deposits (1.5); attend general update/litigation strategy meeting (2.5); review cases and treatise re jurisdiction (3.6).	7.60
04/23/09	AMA	Call with client (1.0); team meeting (1.3); research and revise opposition to intervention motion (11.9).	14.20

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/23/09	BF1	T.c. with D Elsberg re: turnover complaint (.4); litigation team strategy (1.5); review supplemental declaration and conflicts matters (.5); research and revise turnover complaint (3.9).	6.30
04/23/09	CC4	Attend group status meeting.	1.40
04/23/09	DKB	Review emails regarding draft pleadings (.3); team meeting regarding outstanding projects (1.4).	1.70
04/23/09	DLE	Review and give comments on draft turnover papers and teleconf B. Finestone re same (0.7); respond to P. Calamari's question re draft turnover, review draft for same (0.2); prepare for, and participate in, conference call with Board, along with M. Carlinsky (1.2); teleconf R. Williams and others re communication with creditors' group about draft papers (0.8); draft/revise communication to creditors re planned path forward; circulate same to team (0.5); outline list of tasks and circulate to QE partners; team meeting re task list and next steps, follow up meeting re same with E. Parness (1.5); Research facts and review documents for, and start outlining draft of, affidavit of D. Logan re deposits (2); correspond with T. McTaggart re FOIA requests that were done previously and review documents from T. McTaggart re same (0.3).	7.20
04/23/09	EP	Summarize JPMC's claims and WMI's potential Counterclaims and assessment of outcome (5.4); team meeting to discuss potential causes of action (1.4); meeting with D. Elsberg to discuss fact-gathering (.2); preliminary review of FOIA requests Pepper Hamilton served on FDIC and OTS (.2).	7.20
04/23/09	HLD	Draft/revise motion to compel re: deposits (1.3); research re same (.4); conf with QE team re status of all issues (1.4); Draft/revise supplemental S. Kirpalani declaration (.8); emails with QE team re revisions to same (.3).	4.20
04/23/09	JCT	Review and revise S. Kirpalani declaration.	1.00
04/23/09	MBC	Prepare for/attend weekly call (1.3); attend turnover conference call and review draft of related memo (1.5); review emails re issues with creditors; prepare responses on various issues (1.1).	3.90
04/23/09	ML4	Update WMI team's research memo binder.	1.40

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/23/09	MLX	Meet with WMI team re: tasks/strategy going forward (1.3); C.C. with Weil team re: opposition to motion to intervene (.6); legal research re: opposition to motion to intervene (6); review and revise opposition motion to intervene (5.9).	13.80
04/23/09	PC	Emails re: status, timing and scheduling various tasks (.5); Review comments from Creditors on answer, turnover complaint (1.1); prepare for Board Meeting, review agenda, prepare outline for presentation and telephonic participation in Board Meeting (2.5); TC with R. Williams, B. Rosen and Internal Team re: strategy plan, TC M. Carlinsky re: same (.6); TC with R. Williams and B. Rosen re: strategy (.3); revise note for creditors committee on turnover proceeding and numerous emails re: same (.6); emails re: FOIA requests (.2).	5.80
04/23/09	RHP	Review and revise Rule 2004 motion and requests (1.4); Confer with team re claims and counterclaims against JPMC (1.3).	2.70
04/23/09	SK2	TC w/ D. Gropper (Aurelius) re comments to turnover draft (.7); TC w/ J. Pike re same (.3); conf. call w/ C. Smith, R. Williams re turnover complaint, strategy (1.8); meeting w/ D. Elsberg, D. Brown, B. Finestone, others re division and status of tasks for JPMC actions (1.5).	4.30
04/24/09	AMA	Revisions to opposition to motion to compel (.4), review case correspondence (.5).	0.90
04/24/09	BF1	T.c. with H Denman re: registry funds (.3); review and comment upon opposition to motion to intervene (1.4); C.C. with D Elsberg and D Logan re: deposit issues (.6); summarize notes from call (.5); revise turnover complaint (2.8); t.c. N Lapinski re: filing administration (.2); t.c. with B Pfeifer re: strategy issues (.2).	6.00
04/24/09	DKB	Review tax background materials, legal memos and related documents.	5.20
04/24/09	DLE	Review, highlight and outline documents in Weil's Deposit Materials binder (2.3); synthesize with notes from D. Logan interviews and with notes from teleconf's with Weil and C. Smith (1.1); create outline of affidavit of D. Logan and list of follow up questions (1.4).	4.80

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/24/09	EP	Review documents for potential FOIA requests (.5); review elements of potential claims and related facts (4.1).	4.60
04/24/09	HLD	Draft/revise motion (1.1); research re motion to compel (1.9); Email summaries with S. Kirpalani and confer with B. Finestone re same (.3); Revise supplemental S. Kirpalani declaration (.8); TCs/emails with Salpeika (Weil) re same (.3).	4.40
04/24/09	JCT	Review and revise retention application.	1.00
04/24/09	MBC	Read opp to MTN to intervene (1.0); read emails from creditors/Weil (.50).	1.50
04/24/09	ML4	Prepare working group list for WMI team (2.1).	2.10
04/24/09	MLX	Legal research re: counterclaims and draft presentation slides re: same.	5.10
04/24/09	PC	Emails re: Turnover proceeding, TC B. Feifer re: same, update for R. Williams on comments from creditors, comments from D. Logan, comments and response from G. Stanman (2.1); Review opposition of Texas plaintiffs (.3); Review and comment on opposition to motion to intervene, review and send out revised version (1.0); emails re: potential claim, concerns re: issues with FDIC, strategy re: Rule 2004 discovery (.7); emails re: proposed exchange of tax information (.2).	4.30
04/25/09	BF1	Revise turnover complaint in accord with creditors' comments (3.6); review WMI standards (.4); correspond with D Logan re: various exhibits to turnover complaint (.3); email correspondence with Q.E. team re: litigation strategy (.5).	4.80
04/25/09	EP	Researched elements for potential claims and analyzed facts in support of claims (4.9); review documents to develop facts in support of claims (.3).	5.20
04/25/09	MLX	Legal research re: claims and potential counterclaims.	4.90
04/25/09	PC	Attention to comments from R. Johnson re: turnover Complaint and emails re: same (.3).	0.30
04/26/09	AMA	Review turn-over complaint (.7), outline summary judgment motion (1.6).	2.30
04/26/09	BF1	Revise turnover complaint (5.0); respond to further creditor comment and revise pleading in accord (1.8).	6.80

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/26/09	DLE	Edit outline of chronology and of D. Logan affidavit, review additional documents for same (1.8).	1.80
04/26/09	EP	Review documents re claims.	1.10
04/26/09	PC	Numerous emails re: Turnover Complaint, proposed changes and possible calls with creditors re: same, review current drafts of Turnover Complaint and changes to same (1.3); TC C. Smith re: strategy (.5).	1.80
04/27/09	AMA	Research in support of summary judgment on turn-over complaint.	4.20
04/27/09	BF1	Revise turnover complaint (5.8); t.c. with B Pfeifer re: same (.2); t.c. with G Starner (.2); t.c. with B Pfeifer re: account stipulation (.3); t.c. with A Stochak re: account stipulation (.1); t.c. with G Starner re: various comments (.3); research re: automatic stay claim (1.1); administrative filing of complaint against JPMC for turnover (.9).	8.90
04/27/09	DLE	Draft affidavit of D. Logan (4.1); confer with J. Sarles and E. Parness re key legal issues and re their questions about legal research (0.3).	4.40
04/27/09	EP	Review documents in support of potential claims (.6); research elements of potential claims (6.4); correspondence with J. Sarles re: potential claims; (.3); research related facts (1.8).	9.10
04/27/09	HLD	Draft/revise motion to enlarge counterclaim deadline (2.8); emails/confs with QE team re same (.4); legal research re possible arguments in same (2.2).	5.40
04/27/09	JCS	Confer with E. Parness and D. Elsberg re research of potential claims (.3); research re same (3.6).	3.90
04/27/09	MBC	Review and finalize papers for turnover (.70); review 2004 request papers (.50); emails re issues and emails with creditors (1.2).	2.40

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/27/09	PC	Attention to Turnover Complaint, emails re: revised drafts, TC G. Stamer re: same (3.1); TC T. Califano and B. Smith re: Turnover Complaint, TC C. Smith re: same, emails creditors counsel and C. Smith re: same (.4); Attention to filing Complaint, emails re: local counsel (.8); emails A. Siegel and C. Smith re: strategy, TC R. Williams re: same (1.1); Attention to Term Sheet, TC B. Pfeiffer and other creditors counsel, C. Smith, B. Kastourus and B. Rosen re: same (1.1); Discussion and emails re: possible motion re funds (.3); Review and circulate latest 2004 and emails re: same (.4); Conf. Call C. Brouner and C. Smith re: tax discussions and possible confidentiality stipulation (.6).	7.80
04/27/09	RHP	Review and revise Rule 2004 (.3); review and revise motion to extend time (1.2).	1.50
04/27/09	SK2	Conf. call w/ B. Rosen, B. Pfeiffer, V. Melwani (1.0); conf. call w/ J. Pike, M. Kronfeld re comments to turnover action (.2); revise draft complaint to incorporate same (.5); review of turnover complaint (1.1); research counterclaims (3.4).	6.20
04/28/09	AMA	Review bank documents and correspondence re deposit accounts (1.6), research re summary judgment in support of turn-over complaint (4.1); draft summary judgment motion (2.0).	7.70
04/28/09	BF1	Revise rule 2004 motion (2.1); t.c. re: setoff and mutuality issues (.5); revise rule 2004 motion (1.5); review draft Logan affidavit (.9); t.c. re: deposits and setoff issues (.4).	5.40
04/28/09	CC4	Review emails regarding status of litigation and updates.	0.50
04/28/09	DKB	Review emails regarding complaint (.7); call with Curt Brouwer regarding tax issues (1.3); call with Curt Brouwer and A&M team regarding tax issues (1.0); draft summary of tax call and related issues (1.9).	4.90
04/28/09	DLE	Review and give comments on motion seeking extension of time to plead counterclaims (.3).	0.30
04/28/09	EP	Research facts in support of claims (2.3); update memo outlining causes of action (3.2); begin slides for PowerPoint regarding causes of action and potential defenses (2.1).	7.60

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/28/09	HLD	Draft/revise motion to enlarge counterclaim deadline (4.1); legal research re same (3.4); Emails/TCs with QE team re same (.5); Emails/TCs with R. Parker re revisions to same (.5); Draft/revise supplemental S. Kirpalani declaration (.6); Emails with QE team and Salpeika (Weil) re same (.3).	9.40
04/28/09	JCS	Research re potential claims and email with E. Parness re same.	4.70
04/28/09	JCT	Review revised disclosure affidavit for filing.	0.30
04/28/09	MBC	Review and revise Rule 2004 request (1.0); telephone call with Siegel and others re issues (.80); weekly conference call (.70); other calls; review issues re Akin letter (.70); review motion to enlarge (.40).	3.60
04/28/09	MLX	Coordinate slide presentation and email re: same (.3).	0.30
04/28/09	PC	Review news articles re: class action issue (.1); Review 2004 and comments, circulate same, and emails re: same (1.1); Review opp. to motion to intervene and comment, circulate same and emails re: same (.8); Review news reports on deposits, TC Bankruptcy law reporter, New York Post Reporter, emails from A. Siegel re: same (1); Numerous emails and Conf. call C. Smith, R. Williams and B. Rosen re: letter to Board (.9); Emails re: tax claim issues (.2).	4.10
04/28/09	RHP	Review and revise Rule 2004 motion (2.4); review and revise motion to extend time (1.9); TC with H. Denman re same (.5); research re Rule 2004 motion(1.0).	5.80
04/28/09	SK2	Revising draft Rule 2004 motion and revising draft motion to enlarge (.8); research cases/treatises re same (1.0).	1.80
04/29/09	AMA	Call with Doreen Logan (1.6); revisions to Logan Affidavit (1.4); revisions to Intervention Opposition (.8); draft Summary Judgment Motion (5.9).	9.70
04/29/09	BF1	T.c. re: tax setoff issues (.4); t.c. re: turnover summary judgment (.5); t.c. with B Pfeiffer rule 2004 strategy (.3); email correspondence with R Johnson re: 2004 strategy (.2); revise 2004 motion (3.4); TC with P Calamari re: 2004 motion (.2); TC with O Urbietta re: claim research issues (.4); TC with R Parker re: 2004 motion and prep for same (.8).	6.20

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/29/09	DKB	Review draft motion to enlarge time to assert counterclaims (.6); call with Curt Brouwer (.5); review entity structure issues (.5).	1.60
04/29/09	EP	Analyze potential causes of action (6); phone call with J. Sarles to discuss research into potential claims (.3); edit 2004 requests (.3).	6.60
04/29/09	HLD	Draft/revise motion to enlarge counterclaim deadline per QE team comments (3.9); research re same (1.7); emails with B. Finestone and creditors re same (.3).	5.90
04/29/09	JCS	Call with E. Parness re research of potential claims (.3); research re same (3.1); draft summary memo of research (.3).	3.70
04/29/09	MBC	Review 2004 revised papers; review emails re 2004 (.80); review motion to intervene by Creditors (.3); discussions re strategy and options (.4).	1.50
04/29/09	MLX	Review and revise opposition brief to JPMC's motion to intervene in DC action (.7).	0.70
04/29/09	OMU	Discuss research with B. Finestone (.4); Research re 2004 issues (.6).	1.00
04/29/09	PC	Review and revise drafts of motion to expand time (.8); conf. call and emails R. Williams, C. Smith and B. Rosen re: Letter from Committee re: claims and strategy (.9); Emails A. Seigel re: timing of filing (.3); review changes to motion to intervene and circulate (.3); review changes proposed by B. Pfeifer to Rule 2004 application and emails re: same, TC L. Shenkman re: same, review revised drafts of same, conf. B. Finestone re: same (1.0); review and comment on motion to extend time (.8); review credit committee motion to intervene and numerous emails re: same (.4); emails re: tax issues, TC C. Smith re: document production agreement and draft agreement re:same (.4).	4.90
04/29/09	RHP	Review and revise Rule 2004 Motion (1.1); OC with B. Finestone re same (.4).	1.50
04/30/09	AMA	Calls with client re prep of affidavit re deposit accounts (1.0); revisions to intervention opposition (4.6); researching and draft summary judgment motion (6.0).	11.60

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/30/09	BF1	Capital structure review (1.9); prepare/analyze counterclaim (3.7); review Committee comments to 2004 motion (.9); additional research re counterclaim issues (2.4).	8.90
04/30/09	DH3	Email S. Kirpalani regarding board.	0.20
04/30/09	DHB	Review opposition to motion to intervene.	0.80
04/30/09	DKB	Review emails regarding affidavits for possible summary judgment motion (.4); review opposition to motion to intervene (1.4).	1.80
04/30/09	DLE	Interviews of C. Smith re transfer, draft notes and outline of same (1.6); revise D. Logan affidavit and review additional documents received from D. Logan as potential exhibits for affidavit (0.80); review draft slides and outline re potential claims and counterclaims (0.4).	2.80
04/30/09	EP	Review J. Sarles' research related to viability of causes of action (2); edit slides to reflect J. Sarles' additional research and further research potential claims (1.5); correspondence with D. Elsberg and R. Parker regarding research into causes of action (.3); research jurisdictional issues (.2); fact gathering in support of claims (.6).	2.80
04/30/09	HLD	Review revisions to 2004 motion and emails re same with QE team and creditors (.7).	0.70
04/30/09	MBC	Conference call with client and others (1.5); Telephone conference with Sullivan & Cromwell re 2004 (.3); Review 2004 papers for filing (.5).	2.30
04/30/09	MLX	Review and revise opposition brief to JPMC's motion to intervene (6.8); draft papers to opposition brief (.7).	7.50
04/30/09	OMU	Research caselaw re 2004 motion (6.5).	6.50

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours
04/30/09	PC	Review of additional comments (from Akin Gump and Weil) on motion to intervene and final draft, TC R. Johnson and emails re: same (.9); review FDIC filing in response to motion to intervene and emails re: same (.3); Rule 2004 application, TC M. Carlinsky and G. Strarmar re: same, emails re: same, review drafts and numerous comments re: same (.9); Meet and Confer with JPMC re: Rule 2004 and emails re: same, TC T. Califano re: same (1.1); Review draft D. Logan affidavit and emails re: same (.5); review draft letter to P. Gurfein re: issues, emails re: same (.2); review question re: assignment of loans to WMI subs and emails re: same (.8) Routine conf. call with R. Williams and C. Smith, internal; emails (.8); request by White & Case for agreement and emails re: same (.2); TC R. Williams and A. Seigel re: communications (.4); emails re: draft of conf, agreement on taxes (.2); numerous emails re: strategy and claims issues (.3).	5.90
04/30/09	RHP	Draft outline of strategic considerations for counterclaims (1.0); review and revise Rule 2004 Motion and requests (2.2).	3.20
04/30/09	SK2	TC w/ D. Gropper (Aurelius) re administrative and communications issues (1.1); TC w/ C. Smith re next steps for creditors' meeting (.5); Conf. call w/ D. Rosner, T. O'Connor (Kasowitz) re potential claims and defenses (.9); researching points raised by Kasowitz (.8); corresp. to B. Finestone, O. Urbieta re follow-up research needed (.2).	3.50